

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for  
 FOR: 50% Hydrogen Peroxide Solution  
 TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2017)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 8, 2016

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		U.S. Peroxide, LLC 900 Circle 75 Parkway, Suite 1330 Atlanta, GA 30339	Evoqua Water Technologies, LLC 2650 Tallevast Road Sarasota, FL 34243	Univar USA, Inc. 8201 S 212th Kent, WA 98032-1994	DXI Industries, Inc.	ALTIVIA	NOAH Chemical Division Noah Technologies Corp. 1 Noah Park San Antonio, TX 78249	Brenntag Southwest, Inc.					
<b>OPTION 1</b>	<b>Hydrogen Peroxide Solution 50% (6 months)</b>													
	170,000 gallons	Price/ Gallon	2.84	2.94	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
	Bulk Tank Loads - 8,000 gallons a month		482,800.00	499,800.00										
	6 Totes	Price/ Totes	3,250.00	2,799.00										
	Totes/Est. 6 Annually Usage		19,500.00	16,794.00										
	12 months	Price/ Month	675.00	670.00										
	Monthly Facility/Lease Fee		8,100.00	8,040.00										
			*											
	<b>TOTAL OPTION 1</b>	Total	<b>510,400.00</b>	524,634.00										
<b>OPTION 2</b>	<b>Hydrogen Peroxide Solution 50% (3 months)</b>													
	170,000 gallons	Price/ Gallon	2.75	2.94						NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Bulk Tank Loads/ Est. 8,000 gallons a month		467,500.00	499,800.00										
	6 Totes	Price/ Totes	3,250.00	2,799.00										
	Totes/Est. 6 Annually Usage		19,500.00	16,794.00										
	12 months	Price/ Month	675.00	670.00										
	Monthly Facility/Lease Fee		8,100.00	8,040.00										
	<b>TOTAL OPTION 2</b>	TOTAL	495,100.00	524,634.00										
	<b>EXTENSION 1</b>		<b>510,400.00</b>											
	<b>EXTENSION 2</b>		<b>510,400.00</b>											
	<b>EXTENSION 3</b>		<b>510,400.00</b>											
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days										
	Delivery Days													

**\*AWARD OPTION 1**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Altivia  
 Bell Chemical  
 Brenntag  
 Continental Chemical USA  
 DX Group  
 DXI Industries  
 Evoqua Water Technologies

Noah Chemical  
 Rowell Chemical  
 Seidler Chemical  
 Southern Ionics  
 Univar USA  
 US Peroxide

Demandstar  
 SAWS Website